

RESOLUTION 2025-11-24-05

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Concrete Pipe to be Delivered to the lowest responsive bidder Foley Products Co., LLC as follows.

CONCRETE PIPE DELIVERED

POPIT PLUGS							
VENDOR—FOLEY PRODUCTS CO, LLC				VENDOR—WTM VENTURES, LLC			
PRICE PER BOX		200.00		PRICE PER BOX		280.00	
# OF PLUGS IN A BOX		75/BOX		# OF PLUGS IN A BOX		70	
ROUND							
ITEM NUMBER	SIZE	TYPE	CLASS	VENDOR		VENDOR	
				FOLEY PRODUCTS CO, LLC		WTM VENTURES, LLC	
				PRICE PER LF		PRICE PER LF	
1.	12"	RCP	3		28.89	NO BID	
2.	15"	RCP	3		23.25	29.80	
3.	18"	RCP	3		26.96	33.50	
4.	24"	RCP	3		39.72	49.50	
5.	30"	RCP	3		57.06	67.90	
6.	38"	RCP	3		74.76	NO BID	
7.	42"	RCP	3		96.06	116.30	
8.	48"	RCP	3		128.09	159.20	
9.	54"	RCP	3		168.14	NO BID	
10.	60"	RCP	3		214.88	274.00	
11.	66"	RCP	3		295.31	NO BID	
12.	72"	RCP	3		319.56	329.60	
13.	78"	RCP	3		NO BID	NO BID	
14.	84"	RCP	3		540.09	NO BID	

ARCH					
				VENDOR	VENDOR
ITEM NUMBER	SIZE	TYPE	CLASS	FOLEY PRODUCTS CO, LLC	WTM VENTURES, LLC
				PRICE PER LF	PRICE PER LF
1.	(18 X 11) 15"	RCP	3	38.52	NO BID
2.	(22 X 12) 18"	RCP	3	46.23	NO BID
3.	(29 X 18) 24"	RCP	3	65.49	NO BID
4.	(36 X 23) 30"	RCP	3	92.93	NO BID
5.	(44 x 27) 36"	RCP	3	123.27	NO BID
6.	(51 X 31) 42"	RCP	3	167.50	NO BID
7.	(58 x 36) 48"	RCP	3	215.50	NO BID
8.	(65 x 40) 54"	RCP	3	266.51	NO BID
9.	(73 X 45) 60"	RCP	3	332.55	NO BID
10.	(88 X 54) 72"	RCP	3	440.58	NO BID
11.	(102 X 62) 84"	RCP	3	NO BID	NO BID
STRAIGHT WALL					
				VENDOR	VENDOR
ITEM NUMBER	SIZE	TYPE	CLASS	FOLEY PRODUCTS CO, LLC	WTM VENTURES, LLC
				PRICE PER LF	PRICE PER LF
1.	12"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	NO BID	NO BID
2.	15"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	NO BID	NO BID
3.	18"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	NO BID	NO BID
4.	24"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	NO BID	NO BID
5.	30"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	NO BID	NO BID
6.	36"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	NO BID	NO BID
7.	42"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	96.06	NO BID
8.	48"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	128.09	NO BID
9.	54"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	168.14	NO BID
10.	60"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	214.88	NO BID
11.	66"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	295.31	NO BID
12.	72"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	319.56	NO BID
13.	78"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	NO BID	NO BID
14.	84"	RCP STRAIGHT WALL	3	540.09	NO BID

Said eBid #2025-10-11616 is located in the office of the county's Chief Financial Officer.